
ACTION HISTORY OF RTI REQUEST No.DFCCL/R/E/23/00335

Applicant Name SONU

Text of Application

DFCCIL POST INFORMATION 1.What is the sanctioned strength
and the number of vacancies in Corporate Office as well as field
units for the post of Junior Executive department wise? 2.What are
the number of vacancies for the post of Junior executive in Corporate
Office? 3.What are the number of vacancies for the post of Junior
executive in Noida and Meerut Unit ? 4.What is the sanctioned
strength and the number of vacancies in Corporate Office as well as
field units for the post of Junior executive (OP&BD) department
wise? 5.What are the number of vacancies for the post of Junior
executive (OP&BD) in Corporate Office? 6.What are the number of
vacancies for the post of Junior executive (OP&BD) in Noida and
Meerut Unit ? 7.What is the sanctioned strength and the number of
vacancies in Corporate Office as well as field units for the post of
MTS department wise? 8.What are the number of vacancies for the
post of MTS in Corporate Office? 9.Total vacant posts in MTS post till
date. 10.MTS post new recruitment kab aayega.

Reply of Application
Dear applicant, The information you are seeking for is not available
centrally as the same involves various directorates/branches and
project offices. Your application is thus rejected under section 7(9) of
RTI Act 2005.

SN. Action Taken Date of
Action

Action
Taken By Remarks

1 RTI REQUEST
RECEIVED

05/06/2023 Nodal Officer

2 REQUEST
FORWARDED TO

CONCERNED CPIO

06/06/2023 Nodal Officer JGM/CPIO

3 REQUEST DISPOSED
OF

07/06/2023 Nodal Officer
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