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ER Dedicated Freight Corridor Corporation of India Limited
A Govt. of India (Ministry of Railways) Enterprise
No. 2020/HQ/Admin/RTI-661 New Delhi: 28.09.2020
Sh. Prem Raj
Haryana

Subject: Providing information w.r.t. Original Application received under the
RTI Act.2005.

Reference: Your RTI application dated 31.08.2020 received through DOPT.

Information as obtained from the concerned record holding office is attached.

Hope the above information is complete and satisfactory. If not, then you can appeal

within 30 days of receipt of the letter to the 1st Appellate Authority whose name and address
is as under;

Ms. R. P. Chhibber
GGM/Administration DFCCIL,
- 5th Floor, Supreme Court Metro Station Building,
Pragati Maidan, New Delhi-110001.

(S.K. Roy)

Dy. G.M/Admn.(PIO)
E-mail: skroy@dfcc.co.in
011-23454707

DA: 03 sheets
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Dedicated Freight Corridor Corporation of India Ltd,_

ﬁﬁﬁfﬂﬁ%ﬁ o "“iﬁﬁfd‘&ﬂ'ﬁiﬁ”" MR gty

A Govt. of india {Ministry of Railways) Enterprise
D-89, 1% Floor, Sector-2, Noida-201301
Ph: 0120-4269832, Fax: 0120-4193877

DFCC/Noida/HR/RTI/16/ 3864 Dated:- 26.9.2020

To
PIO/DFCCIL
RTI Cell,
Corporate office,
New Delhi-01
{Kind Att- Sh. SK Roy, DGM/HR. PIO)

Sub:- Providing information under the RTI Act-2005
Ref:- RTI-661 of sh. Premraj.,Faridabad ,dated 31.8.2020

In reference to subject matter and RTI-661, reply received from concerned department
is enclosed herewith

Mé |q]200
Dy.PM/APIO
DFCCIL/Noida Unit
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Email mkupadhayay@dft?“ .co.in

Fwd: Reminder of RTI-661

From : YogendraPal Sharma <ypsharma@dfcc.co.in> Sat, Sep 26, 2020 12:07 PM
Subject : Fwd: Reminder of RTI-661 2 attachments

To : MADHUPKUMAR UPADHAYAY
- <mkupadhayay@dfcc.co.in>

PFA

From: SRMP@iIntecc.com

To: "YogendraPal Sharma" <ypsharma@dfcc.co.in>
Cc: Csrinivas@intecc.com, smp@Intecc.com

Sent: Saturday, September 19, 2020 11:47.37 AM
Subject: Reminder of RTI-661

Dear Sir

We would like to inform you that on 16.09.2020 we have called both parties Mr. Prem Raj
- Land owner & Mr. Pratap Singh earth work agency for meeting. After long discussion
with both the parties it has been decided that Mr. Pratap - S/C agreed to pay Rs. 5 Lakh
FULL & FINAL payment to Mr. Prem Raj. The said amount shall be paid by S/C within 45

days w.e.f. 16.09.2020.Also It has been agreed by both the part;es that after receiving the
said.amount Mr. Prem Raj will withdraw the court case.

Copy of written confirmation letter given by S/C is attached for your reference.

Regards,
Sreeramamurthy.

From: Pachipulusu S R Murthi <SRMP@Intecc.com>

Sent: 15 September 2020 19:46

To: ypsharma@dfcc.co.in <ypsharma@dfcc.co.in>

Cc: C Srinivas Rao <Csrinivas@Intecc.com>; Rakesh Kumar Jha

<RAKESHKUMARJIHA®@Intecc.com>; Shashank Pachhade <smp@Ilntecc.com>
Subject: FW: Reminder of RTI-661

Dear Sir,

Talking to both the parties. Please attow 3 a_te 4 da}[ms:ﬂgg}g:&.w\fve will reporttoyoy, 1

Regards,
Sreeramamurthy.
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